Village of Oak Park

2023 Business District Landscape Maintenance Bid Summary

Alvarez Diaz Landscape City Escape Garden and Design Cleanslate Chicago Landscape Concepts McAdam Landscape

Spring Clean | Fall Clean | Total per Spring Clean | Fall Clean | Total per Spring Clean| Fall Clean | Total per Spring | Fall Clean | Total per | Total per | Spring Clean| Fall Clean | Total per Spring Clean | Fall Clean | Total per
Business District Up Up Month Total per Year Up Up Month Total per Year Up. Up Month Total per Year | Clean Up Up Month Year Up. Up. Month | Total per Year Up Up Month _ [Total per Year|
1[North Ave. $745.00 $585.00 $200.00 2,930.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $400.00 $198.00 $130.00 $1,638.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $196.00 $122.00 $167.00 $1,654.00
2| Chicago Ave. East $1,712.50 $567.00 $648.00 7,463.50| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,412.00 $697.00 $458.00 $5,773.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,290.00 $648.00 $500.00 $5,938.00
3| Chicago Ave. West $419.00 $162.00 200.00 2,181.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $219.00 108.00 $71.00 $895.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $297.00 $186.00 $58.00 $947.00
4/|Lake St. East $1,996.00 $567.00 405.00 $5,803.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,488.00 734.00 $483.00 $6,086.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,430.00 $852.00 $500.00 $6,282.00
5|Hemingway District $563.00 $563.00 405.00 $4,366.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $978.00 483.00 $318.00 $4,005.00{No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $345.00 $397.00 418.00 $4,086.00
6]South Marion $800.00 $302.00 200.00 $2,702.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $772.00 $381.00 $251.00 $3,161.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $818.00 $447.00 249.00 $3,257.00
7| Madison St. $3,263.00 $702.00 972.00 $11,741.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,744.00 $861.00 $566.00 $7,133.00{No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,448.00 $846.00 500.00 $7,294.00
8| Arts District $2,117.00 $936.00 $648.00 $8,237.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,104.00] $1,039.00 $683.00 $8,607.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,144.00] $1,167.00 $668.00 $8,655.00
9|South Town $486.00 $324.00 $200.00 $2,410.00{No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $437.00 $216.00 $142.00 $1,789.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $298.00 $190.00 $167.00 $1,824.00
10|Roosevelt $1,262.00 $500.00 $200.00 $3,362.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $817.00 $403.00 $265.00 $3,340.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $944.00 $508.00 $250.00 $3,452.00
11)|Downtown Oak Park $4,012.00] $1,206.00 $972.00 $12,994.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,440.00] $1,205.00 $792.00 $9,981.00[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,728.00| $1,234.00 $665.00 10,282.00
Total for Year: $64,189.50 No Bid $52,408.00 No Bid No Bid $53,671.00




City Escape

Alvarez, Inc. Diaz Landscape Cleanslate Chicago Landscape Concepts McAdam Landscape
Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
Estimated Sqg. Yd Total per Sqg. Yd Total per Sqg. Yd Total per Sqg. Yd Total per Sqg. Yd Total per Sq. Yd Total per
Maintenance Type | Area (sq.yd.)| /month Month Total per Year | /month Month Total per Year | /month Month Total per Year | /month Month Total per Year | /month Month Total per Year /month Month Total per Year
1 Turf Area 49,324.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $5,259.87 $42,078.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Planter Bed Area 16,379.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.20 $3,428.40 $27,427.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Spring Clean-up No Bid No Bid $14,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Fall Clean-up No Bid No Bid $5,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total for year: No Bid Total for year: No Bid Total for year:| $88,906.16 |Total for year: No Bid Total for year: No Bid Total for year: No Bid




	Buisness Districts
	Regular Landscape

