Village of Oak Park
2024 Parkway Tree Cycle Pruning

A&B Tree Service Davis Tree Care, Inc. Kramer Tree Specialist Winkler Services LLC
No D.B.H Est. # Unit Price | Total by class | Unit Price Total by class Unit Price | Total by class | Unit Price | Total by class
1 1"-4" 898 No Bid No Bid $22.00 S 19,756.00 | $29.00 ' $ 26,042.00| $60.00 | $ 53,880.00
2 5"-6" 558 No Bid No Bid $26.00 S 14,508.00 $39.00 S 21,762.00 $60.50 S 33,759.00
3 7"-12" 1494 No Bid No Bid $44.00 S 65,736.00 | $70.00 ' $ 104,580.00| $85.50 | $ 127,737.00
4 12" - 20" 2160 No Bid No Bid $92.00 @S 198,720.00 | $238.00 S 514,080.00 $99.00 S 213,840.00
5 21"-30" 1290 No Bid No Bid $130.00 | $ 167,700.00 | $330.00 $ 425,700.00 | $165.75 | $ 213,817.50
6 31" and Over 321 No Bid No Bid $185.00 | S 59,385.00 | $460.00 | $ 147,660.00| $262.50 S  84,262.50
Total: No Bid S 525,805.00 $ 1,239,824.00 $ 727,296.00
2 men Chipper truck w/chipper $198.45 $260.00 $270.00 $250.00
1 man Aerial Lift Truck $132.30 $160.00 $140.00 $125.00
1 man Log Loader $132.30 $160.00 $140.00 $150.00
1 man Semi Tractor-trailer $132.30 $140.00 $300.00
1 man Crane $132.30 $225.00 $350.00
Laborer $55.13 $110.00 $135.00 $125.00
A&B Tree Service Davis Tree Care, Inc. Kramer Tree Specialist Winkler Services LLC
No D.B.H g\llag Est. #| Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class
1 0"-11" 10 1 $3.31 S 33.10 No Bid No Bid $19.00 S 190.00 No Bid No Bid
2 12"-18" 15 5 $8.27 S 620.25 No Bid No Bid $49.00 S 3,675.00 No Bid No Bid
3 19"-24" 21 8 $12.13 S 2,037.84 No Bid No Bid $70.00 S 11,760.00 No Bid No Bid
4 25"-30" 27 14 $14.33 S 5,416.74 No Bid No Bid $79.00 S 29,862.00 No Bid No Bid
5 31"-36" 33 14 $18.74 S 8,657.88 No Bid No Bid $90.00 S 41,580.00 No Bid No Bid
6 37" and Over 38 8 $18.74 S 5,696.96 No Bid No Bid $95.00 S 28,880.00 No Bid No Bid
Winter Removal Total: S 22,462.77 No Bid S 115,947.00 No Bid
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A&B Tree Service Davis Tree Care, Inc. Kramer Tree Specialist Winkler Services LLC
No D.B.H AD\|/ag Est. #| Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class
1 0"-11" 10 1 $8.28 S 82.80 No Bid No Bid $18.00 $ 180.00 No Bid No Bid
2 12"-18" 15 27 $12.68 S 5,135.40 No Bid No Bid $49.00 S 19,845.00 No Bid No Bid
3 19"-24" 21 44 $21.50 S 19,866.00 No Bid No Bid $70.00 S 64,680.00 No Bid No Bid
4 25"-30" 26 41 $25.36 S 27,033.76 No Bid No Bid $79.00 S 84,214.00 No Bid No Bid
5 31"-36" 33 23 $31.43 S 23,855.37 No Bid No Bid $90.00 S 68,310.00 No Bid No Bid
6 37" and Over 41 14 $38.59 S 22,150.66 No Bid No Bid $95.00 S 54,530.00 No Bid No Bid
Summer Removal Total: S 98,123.99 No Bid S 291,759.00 No Bid
Total Removal Price: S 120,586.76 No Bid S 407,706.00 No Bid
2024 Parkway Tree Removal Emergency Call Out Rates Per Hour
2 men Chipper truck w/chipper $198.45 No Bid No Bid $270.00 No Bid
1 man Aerial Lift Truck $132.30 No Bid No Bid $140.00 No Bid
1 man Log Loader $132.30 No Bid No Bid $140.00 No Bid
1 man Semi Tractor-trailer $132.30 No Bid No Bid $140.00 No Bid
1 man Crane $132.30 No Bid No Bid $225.00 No Bid
Laborer $55.13 No Bid No Bid $135.00 No Bid
2024 Parkway Tree Stump Removals
A&B Tree Service Davis Tree Care, Inc. Kramer Tree Specialist Winkler Services LLC
No. Grind Type Est. # Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total
1 Full Grind 200 $275.63 S  55,126.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D24 Pa ay Restoratio ate pe guare Yarad
Parkway Restoration with Sod $11.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Park District of Oak Park

2024 Park Tree Cycle Pruning

No. Park A&B Tree Service Davis Tree Care, Inc. Kramer Tree Specialist Winkler Services LLC
1 Barrie Park (47 Trees) No Bid $3,760.00 $11,450.00 $6,000.00
2 Carroll Park (22 Trees) No Bid $1,760.00 $3,410.00 $3,600.00
3 Euclid Park (30 Trees) No Bid $2,400.00 $6,130.00 $5,000.00
4 Maple Park (110 Trees No Bid $8,800.00 $28,180.00 $10,500.00
5 Rehm Park (99 Trees) No Bid $7,920.00 $24,260.00 $13,500.00
Total: $0.00 $24,640.00 $73,430.00 $38,600.00
A&B Tree Service Davis Tree Care, Inc. Kramer Tree Specialist Winkler Services LLC
No. D.B.H S Price per inch S Price per inch S Price per inch S Price per inch
1 o"-10" No Bid $10.00 $23.00 $30.00
2 10.1" - 18" No Bid $16.00 $63.00 $30.00
3 18.1"-24" No Bid $23.00 $70.00 $48.00
4 24.1"-30" No Bid $29.00 $85.00 $58.00
5 30.1"-36" No Bid $38.00 $90.00 $75.00
6 36.1" and Over No Bid $43.00 $95.00 $80.00
2024 Emergency Call Out Rates Per Hour
2 men Chipper truck w/chipper $198.45 $260.00 $270.00 $250.00
1 man Aerial Lift Truck $132.30 $160.00 $140.00 $125.00
1 man Log Loader $132.30 $160.00 $140.00 $150.00
1 man Semi Tractor-trailer $132.30 $140.00 $300.00
Laborer $55.13 $110.00 $135.00 $125.00
2024 Alternative Non-Emergency Call Out Rates Per Hour
2 men Chipper truck w/chipper $198.45 $200.00 $210.00 $180.00
1 man Aerial Lift Truck $132.30 $125.00 $110.00 $90.00
1 man Log Loader $132.30 $125.00 $110.00 $125.00
1 man Semi Tractor-trailer $132.30 $125.00 $250.00
Laborer $55.13 $100.00 $105.00 $90.00

OF BIDDERS.

THE VILLAGE AND PARK DISTRCIT OF OAK PARK ARE STILL WORKING TO CONFIRM THE QUALIFICATION




